
RFB-2019-002

Road Materials

RB Pct. 1

Vulcan 37 Mining

Arcosa Aggregates 

(formerly Trinity 

Materials) Alvarado Sand and Gravel

Martin Marietta Materials, 

Inc.  Rattler Rock, Inc Texas Bit Big City Crushed Concrete JLB Contracting Road Rescue

Kevin Vaughn - 210-524-

3577 - 

vaughnkm@vcmmail.com

Kevin Boyd - 817-341-8744 - 

kboyd@37bp.com

Bryan Gay - 972-207-2680 - 

bryan.gay@arcosa.com

Pedro Martinez - 817-938-

5001 - 

pedro@alvaradosand.com

David Sobczak - 405-312-

3894 - 

David.Sobczak@martinma

rietta.com

 Charles Davis - 254-874-

5282 - 

rattlerrock@yahoo.com 

Chris Michael - 214-741-3531 

- chris.michael@texasbit.com

Josh Hylkema - 972-243-

5820 - josh@bccclp.com

Terry Patterson - 817-261-

2991 - 

tpatterson@jlbcontracting.

com

Terry Applewhite - 817-805-

0644 - 

lapplewhite@roadrescueasp

halt.com

CRUSHED LIMESTONE

Type D, Grade 3 No Bid $21.00 per ton picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type D, Grade 4

$22.00 per ton picked up / 

$39.61 per ton delivered $21.00 per ton picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type D, Grade 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fine D

$8.00 picked up / $25.61 per 

ton delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):  Manufactured Sand No Bid $10.00 per ton picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):  1" (#57) Crushed 

Limestone No Bid $12.00 per ton picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations Weatherford, TX Palo Pinto, TX  76484

CRUSHED LIMESTONE FLEX BASE

Type A, Grade 1

$10.00 picked up / $27.61 

per ton delivered $8.00 per ton picked up

$12.50 per ton picked up / 

$23.25 delivered - Grade 1 

and Grade 2 No Bid
$8.00 per ton picked up / 

$26.00 per ton delivered $6.00 per ton picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type A, Grade 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
$5.75 per ton picked up / 

$5.95 per mile delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations Palo Pinto, TX  76484

Wills Point 11630 CR 314, 

Terrell, TX 75161 Blum, TX Chico Blum, TX

CRUSHED CONCRETE FLEX BASE

Type D, Grade 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$9.00 per ton picked up / 

$18.50 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid

Type D, Grade 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$9.00 per ton picked up / 

$18.50 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):

Pick up Locations

Grade 1 and 2 - 11143 

Goodnight Lane, Dallas, TX  

75229 or 1005 Forest Ave., 

Dallas, TX  75215
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RFB-2019-002

Road Materials

RB Pct. 1

Vulcan 37 Mining

Arcosa Aggregates 

(formerly Trinity 

Materials) Alvarado Sand and Gravel

Martin Marietta Materials, 

Inc.  Rattler Rock, Inc Texas Bit Big City Crushed Concrete JLB Contracting Road Rescue

Kevin Vaughn - 210-524-

3577 - 

vaughnkm@vcmmail.com

Kevin Boyd - 817-341-8744 - 

kboyd@37bp.com

Bryan Gay - 972-207-2680 - 

bryan.gay@arcosa.com

Pedro Martinez - 817-938-

5001 - 

perdro@alvaradosand.com

David Sobczak - 405-312-

3894 - 

David.Sobczak@martinma

rietta.com

 Charles Davis - 254-874-

5282 - 

rattlerrock@yahoo.com 

Chris Michael - 214-741-3531 

- chris.michael@texasbit.com

Josh Hylkema - 972-243-

5820 - josh@bccclp.com

Terry Patterson - 817-261-

2991 - 

tpatterson@jlbcontracting.

com

Terry Applewhite - 817-805-

0644 - 

lapplewhite@roadrescueasp

halt.com

LIGHTWEIGHT AGGREGATE

Type L, Grade 3 No Bid No Bid
$55.00 per ton picked up / 

$62.50 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type L, Grade 4 No Bid No Bid
$55.00 per ton picked up / 

$62.50 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type L, Grade5 No Bid No Bid
$45.00 per ton picked up / 

$52.50 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): Blue Base
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$5.00 per ton picked up 

(when available) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): 1" x 3" Oversize
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$7.00 per ton picked up 

(when available) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): 3" x 5" Oversize
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$7.00 per ton picked up 

(when available) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations
Streetman

WASHED PEA GRAVEL

Type A, Grade 4
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type A, Grade 5
No Bid No Bid

$8.00 per ton picked up / 

$13.50 delivered

$10.00 per ton picked up/ 

$5.95 per mile delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):

Pick up Locations

Cottonwood 18400 Pilgrim 

Road, Rosser, TX 75157

25 miles -Trinity Rosser  

Plant - Trinity Materials, 

18400 Pilgrim Rd., 

Rosser TX  75157

PIT RUN GRAVEL

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations

RIP RAP

No Bid No Bid No Bid
$23.00 per ton picked up / 

$5.95 per mile delivered

$18.00 per ton picked up / 

$41.80 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations
Blum, TX Chico

HOT MIX, COLD LAID ASPHALT 

CONCRETE

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$85.00 per ton picked up /  

$.32 per ton per mile delivered - 

Sunnyvale Plant Only No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):

Pick up Locations
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RFB-2019-002

Road Materials

RB Pct. 1

Vulcan 37 Mining

Arcosa Aggregates 

(formerly Trinity 

Materials) Alvarado Sand and Gravel

Martin Marietta Materials, 

Inc.  Rattler Rock, Inc Texas Bit Big City Crushed Concrete JLB Contracting Road Rescue

Kevin Vaughn - 210-524-

3577 - 

vaughnkm@vcmmail.com

Kevin Boyd - 817-341-8744 - 

kboyd@37bp.com

Bryan Gay - 972-207-2680 - 

bryan.gay@arcosa.com

Pedro Martinez - 817-938-

5001 - 

perdro@alvaradosand.com

David Sobczak - 405-312-

3894 - 

David.Sobczak@martinma

rietta.com

 Charles Davis - 254-874-

5282 - 

rattlerrock@yahoo.com 

Chris Michael - 214-741-3531 

- chris.michael@texasbit.com

Josh Hylkema - 972-243-

5820 - josh@bccclp.com

Terry Patterson - 817-261-

2991 - 

tpatterson@jlbcontracting.

com

Terry Applewhite - 817-805-

0644 - 

lapplewhite@roadrescueasp

halt.com

HOT MIX ASPHALT

Type D, Hot Mix

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$65.00 per ton picked up - 50 

ton minium / $.32 per ton per 

mile delivered - Alvarado, 

Sunnyvale, Terrell Plant No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):  SSM

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$62.00 per ton picked up / $.32 

per ton per mile delivered - 

Terrell Plant Only No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations

CRUSHED ASPHALT

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$9.00 per ton picked up / 

$18.50 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations

11143 Goodnight Lane, 

Dallas, TX  75229 - Plant 

Only

ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PATCHING 

MATERIAL - 50LB BAG

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$14.00 per bag / $14.00 

delivered

$9.49 picked up / $11.00 per 

page delivered - 62 bag 

minimum

Other items (if applicable):

Pick up Locations Fort Worth, TX Uvalde, Texas

ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PATCHING 

MATERIAL - STOCKPILE

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$105.00 per ton / $.32 per mile 

per ton delivered - Alvarado 

and Terrell Plant Only No Bid
$100.00 per ton picked up / 

$108.00 per ton delivered

$121.91 per cubic yard - Full 

Truck Load Minimum

Other items (if applicable):

Pick up Locations Fort Worth, TX Uvalde, Texas
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RFB-2019-002

Road Materials

RB Pct. 1

RFB-2019-001 Hauling Road Material

CKJ Transport of North Texas

DIESEL FUEL PRICE PRICE PER MILE END DUMP BELLY DUMP FLAT BED DELIVERY

MINIMUM DELIVERY 

AMOUNT

$1.50-$1.99 5.86$                                    15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$2.00-$2.49 5.86$                                    15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$2.50-$2.99 5.86$                                    15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$3.00-$3.49 5.86$                                    15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$3.50-$3.99 5.86$                                    15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$4.00-$4.49 5.86$                                    15+ 0 No 26 Tons

CKJ Transport Of North Texas

1650 W Virginia ST.

Suite 200

McKinney, TX 75069

972-808-7660

Alvarado Sand & Gravel, LLC

DIESEL FUEL PRICE PRICE PER MILE END DUMP BELLY DUMP FLAT BED DELIVERY

MINIMUM DELIVERY 

AMOUNT

$1.50-$1.99

$2.00-$2.49

$2.50-$2.99

$3.00-$3.49 $5.95

$3.50-$3.99

$4.00-$4.49

Alvarado Sand & Gravel, LLC

4372 135 W

Alvarado, TX 76009

817-938-5001
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RFB-2019-002

Road Materials

RB Pct. 1

Wright Asphalt Cleveland Asphalt Ergon Asphalt

Description

Plant Pick Up Per Unit of 

Measure

FOB Precinct / Job Site Mileage 

Rate / Unit of Measure Price

Plant Pick Up Per Unit of 

Measure

FOB Precinct / Job Site Mileage 

Rate / Unit of Measure Price

Plant Pick Up Per Unit of 

Measure

FOB Precinct / Job Site Mileage 

Rate / Unit of Measure Price

CRS-2 $1.77 per gallon $2.0043 per gallon $1.95 per gallon or $473.85 per ton $2.16 per gallon or $524.88 per ton $2.00 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

CRS-2H No Bid $1.95 per gallon or $473.85 per ton $2.16 per gallon or $524.88 per ton $2.00 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

MS-2 No Bid $2.05 per gallon or $498.15 per gallon $2.26 per gallon or $549.18 per ton $2.20 per gallon $.20 per mile per gallon

HFRS-2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.05 per gallon $.20 per mile per gallon

RC-250 3.25 per gallon $3.4843 per gallon $3.35 per gallon or $837.50 per ton $3.56 per gallon or $890.0 per ton No Bid No Bid

AC-5 $2.55 per gallon $2.7900 per gallon $2.77 per gallon or $637.10 per ton $2.98 per gallon or $685.40 per ton $530.00 per ton $32.00 per mile per ton

AC-10 $2.45 per gallon $2.6900 per gallon $2.77 per gallon or $637.10 per ton $2.98 per gallon or $685.40 per ton $520.00 per ton $32.00 per mile per ton

AC-15P 3% Polymer No Bid No Bid No Bid $655.00 per ton $32.00 per mile per ton

AC-15XP 2% Polymer No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

MC-30 $3.10 per gallon $3.3400 per gallon $3.85 per gallon or $933.30 per ton $4.06 per gallon or $1047.48 per ton No Bid No Bid

CRS-1P No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.45 per gallon $.35 per mile per gallon

P2 Prime No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

P2 Prime Emulsifies Concentrate No Bid No Bid No Bid

Diluted AEP: 40% H2O/60% product No Bid

$1.55 per gallon** or $390.60 per 

ton** $1.76 per gallon or $443.52 per ton $1.62 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

Diluted AEP:  50% H2O/50% product No Bid

$1.45 per gallon** or $365.40 per 

ton** $1.66 per gallon or $418.32 per ton $1.40 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

Diluted AEP:  60% H2O/40% product No Bid $1.35 per gallon** or $340.20 per ton $1.56 per gallon or $393.12 per ton $1.18 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

CWE/CWP2 Emulsified Asphalt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rate of Demurrage per hour $85.00 per hour $80.00 per hour after 2 free hours $80.00 per hour after 2 free hours

Minimum Order, if applicable

On MC 30 and RC 250 only 1,000 

gallon minimum 5000 gallons  21 tons

No minimum order, however freight is 

based on a full transport load (approx. 

5,500 gallons or 24 tons), even if a 

full load is not ordered

Other Fees:

Freight figured on full transport loads.  

Minimum freight charge of 5,500 

gallons.  $450 overnight fee.  $75 

diversion fee.  Pump charge of $100.  

Demurrage 2 hours free then $85 per 

hour as stated above.  All pricing in 

gallons.  Only tanker transports to be 

used and no belly dumps or tandems 

as referred to on page 16, item 1, letter 

G.  Return loads will be billed at 1/2 

outgoing freight.  Diluted loads cannot 

be returned.  Contact Kody Kohl, Cell 

512-517-5998 for return loads. Loads 

canceled in transit will be billed at 

cost.

Diluted loads cannot be returned.  Call 

24 hours before delivery time to cancel 

the delivery

Pump charge is $90.00 per load.  

Return freight is one-half of the 

outgoing tariff.  Delivery time is 24 

hours following receipt of the order.

CRS-2+ $2.15 per gallon CRS-2+ $2.29 per gallon delivered

CRS-2P $2.30 per galon CRS-2P $2.44 per gallon delivered
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RFB-2019-002

Road Materials

RB Pct. 2

Vulcan 37 Mining

Arcosa Aggregates 

(formerly Trinity 

Materials) Alvarado Sand and Gravel

Martin Marietta Materials, 

Inc.  Rattler Rock, Inc Texas Bit Big City Crushed Concrete JLB Contracting Road Rescue

Kevin Vaughn - 210-524-

3577 - 

vaughnkm@vcmmail.com

Kevin Boyd - 817-341-8744 - 

kboyd@37bp.com

Bryan Gay - 972-207-2680 - 

bryan.gay@arcosa.com

Pedro Martinez - 817-938-

5001 - 

pedro@alvaradosand.com

David Sobczak - 405-312-

3894 - 

David.Sobczak@martinmar

ietta.com

 Charles Davis - 254-874-

5282 - 

rattlerrock@yahoo.com 

Chris Michael - 214-741-3531 

- chris.michael@texasbit.com

Josh Hylkema - 972-243-

5820 - josh@bccclp.com

Terry Patterson - 817-261-

2991 - 

tpatterson@jlbcontracting.

com

Terry Applewhite - 817-805-

0644 - 

lapplewhite@roadrescueasp

halt.com

CRUSHED LIMESTONE

Type D, Grade 3 No Bid $21.00 per ton picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type D, Grade 4

$22.00 per ton picked up / 

$40.55 per ton delivered $21.00 per ton picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type D, Grade 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fine D

$8.00 picked up / $26.55 per 

ton delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):  Manufactured Sand No Bid $10.00 per ton picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):  1" (#57) Crushed 

Limestone No Bid $12.00 per ton picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations Weatherford, TX Palo Pinto, TX  76484 Blum, TX

CRUSHED LIMESTONE FLEX BASE

Type A, Grade 1

$10.00 picked up / $40.55 per 

ton delivered $8.00 per ton picked up

$12.50 per ton picked up / 

$23.25 delivered - Grade 1 

and Grade 2 No Bid

$8.00 per ton picked up / 

$26.00 per ton delivered $6.00 per ton picked up

Type A, Grade 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid

$5.75 per ton picked up / 

$5.95 per mile delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations
Weatherford, TX Palo Pinto, TX  76484

Wills Point 11630 CR 314, 

Terrell, TX 75161 Blum, TX Chico Blum, TX

CRUSHED CONCRETE FLEX BASE

Type D, Grade 1
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$9.00 per ton picked up / 

$20.50 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid

Type D, Grade 2
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$9.00 per ton picked up / 

$20.50 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Grade 1 and 2 - 11143 

Goodnight Lane, Dallas, TX  

75229 or 1005 Forest Ave., 

Dallas, TX  75215 No Bid No Bid

6 of 21



RFB-2019-002

Road Materials

RB Pct. 2

Vulcan 37 Mining

Arcosa Aggregates 

(formerly Trinity 

Materials) Alvarado Sand and Gravel

Martin Marietta Materials, 

Inc.  Rattler Rock, Inc Texas Bit Big City Crushed Concrete JLB Contracting Road Rescue

Kevin Vaughn - 210-524-

3577 - 

vaughnkm@vcmmail.com

Kevin Boyd - 817-341-8744 - 

kboyd@37bp.com

Bryan Gay - 972-207-2680 - 

bryan.gay@arcosa.com

Pedro Martinez - 817-938-

5001 - 

perdro@alvaradosand.com

David Sobczak - 405-312-

3894 - 

David.Sobczak@martinmar

ietta.com

 Charles Davis - 254-874-

5282 - 

rattlerrock@yahoo.com 

Chris Michael - 214-741-3531 

- chris.michael@texasbit.com

Josh Hylkema - 972-243-

5820 - josh@bccclp.com

Terry Patterson - 817-261-

2991 - 

tpatterson@jlbcontracting.

com

Terry Applewhite - 817-805-

0644 - 

lapplewhite@roadrescueasp

halt.com

LIGHTWEIGHT AGGREGATE

Type L, Grade 3 No Bid No Bid

$55.00 per ton picked up / 

$61.00 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type L, Grade 4 No Bid No Bid

$55.00 per ton picked up / 

$61.00 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type L, Grade5 No Bid No Bid

$45.00 per ton picked up / 

$51.00 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): Blue Base No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$5.00 per ton picked up 

(when available) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): 1" x 3" Oversize No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$7.00 per ton picked up 

(when available) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): 3" x 5" Oversize No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$7.00 per ton picked up 

(when available) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Location Streetman

WASHED PEA GRAVEL

Type A, Grade 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type A, Grade 5 No Bid No Bid

$8.00 per ton picked up / 

$13.50 delivered

$10.00 per ton picked up/ 

$5.95 per mile delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations

Cottonwood 18400 Pilgrim 

Road, Rosser, TX 75157

20 miles -Trinity Rosser  

Plant - Trinity Materials, 

18400 Pilgrim Rd., Rosser 

TX  75157

PIT RUN GRAVEL

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations

RIP RAP

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$23.00 per ton picked up / 

$5.95 per mile delivered

$18.00 per ton picked up / 

$41.80 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations Chico

HOT MIX, COLD LAID ASPHALT 

CONCRETE

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$85.00 per ton picked up /  

$.32 per ton per mile delivered - 

Sunnyvale Plant Only No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations
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RFB-2019-002

Road Materials

RB Pct. 2

Vulcan 37 Mining

Arcosa Aggregates 

(formerly Trinity 

Materials) Alvarado Sand and Gravel

Martin Marietta Materials, 

Inc.  Rattler Rock, Inc Texas Bit Big City Crushed Concrete JLB Contracting Road Rescue

Kevin Vaughn - 210-524-

3577 - 

vaughnkm@vcmmail.com

Kevin Boyd - 817-341-8744 - 

kboyd@37bp.com

Bryan Gay - 972-207-2680 - 

bryan.gay@arcosa.com

Pedro Martinez - 817-938-

5001 - 

perdro@alvaradosand.com

David Sobczak - 405-312-

3894 - 

David.Sobczak@martinmar

ietta.com

 Charles Davis - 254-874-

5282 - 

rattlerrock@yahoo.com 

Chris Michael - 214-741-3531 

- chris.michael@texasbit.com

Josh Hylkema - 972-243-

5820 - josh@bccclp.com

Terry Patterson - 817-261-

2991 - 

tpatterson@jlbcontracting.

com

Terry Applewhite - 817-805-

0644 - 

lapplewhite@roadrescueasp

halt.com

HOT MIX ASPHALT

Type D, Hot Mix No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$65.00 per ton picked up - 50 

ton minium / $.32 per ton per 

mile delivered - Alvarado, 

Sunnyvale, Terrell Plant No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):  SSM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$62.00 per ton picked up / $.32 

per ton per mile delivered - 

Terrell Plant Only No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations

CRUSHED ASPHALT

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$9.00 per ton picked up / 

$20.50 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):

Pick up Locations

11143 Goodnight Lane, 

Dallas, TX  75229 - Plant 

Only

ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PATCHING 

MATERIAL - 50LB BAG

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$14.00 per bag / $14.00 

delivered

$9.49 picked up / $11.00 per 

page delivered - 62 bag 

minimum

Other items (if applicable):

Pick up Locations Fort Worth, TX Uvalde, Texas

ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PATCHING 

MATERIAL - STOCKPILE

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$105.00 per ton / $.32 per mile 

per ton delivered - Alvarado 

and Terrell Plant Only No Bid

$100.00 per ton picked up / 

$108.00 per ton delivered

$121.91 per cubic yard - Full 

Truck Load Minimum

Other items (if applicable):

Pick up Locations Fort Worth, TX Uvalde, Texas

8 of 21



RFB-2019-002

Road Materials

RB Pct. 2

RFB-2019-001 Hauling Road Material

CKJ Transport of North Texas

DIESEL FUEL PRICE PRICE PER MILE END DUMP BELLY DUMP FLAT BED DELIVERY

MINIMUM DELIVERY 

AMOUNT

$1.50-$1.99 5.86$                                     15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$2.00-$2.49 5.86$                                     15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$2.50-$2.99 5.86$                                     15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$3.00-$3.49 5.86$                                     15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$3.50-$3.99 5.86$                                     15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$4.00-$4.49 5.86$                                     15+ 0 No 26 Tons

CKJ Transport Of North Texas

1650 W Virginia ST.

Suite 200

McKinney, TX 75069

972-808-7660

Alvarado Sand & Gravel, LLC

DIESEL FUEL PRICE PRICE PER MILE END DUMP BELLY DUMP FLAT BED DELIVERY

MINIMUM DELIVERY 

AMOUNT

$1.50-$1.99

$2.00-$2.49

$2.50-$2.99

$3.00-$3.49 $5.95

$3.50-$3.99

$4.00-$4.49

Alvarado Sand & Gravel, LLC

4372 135 W

Alvarado, TX 76009

817-938-5001
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RFB-2019-002

Road Materials

RB Pct. 2

Wright Asphalt Cleveland Asphalt Ergon Asphalt

Description

Plant Pick Up Per Unit of 

Measure

FOB Precinct / Job Site Mileage 

Rate / Unit of Measure Price

Plant Pick Up Per Unit of 

Measure

FOB Precinct / Job Site Mileage 

Rate / Unit of Measure Price

Plant Pick Up Per Unit of 

Measure

FOB Precinct / Job Site Mileage 

Rate / Unit of Measure Price

CRS-2 $1.77 per gallon $2.0043 per gallon $1.95 per gallon or $473.85 per ton $2.16 per gallon or $524.88 per ton $2.00 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

CRS-2H No Bid $1.95 per gallon or $473.85 per ton $2.16 per gallon or $524.88 per ton $2.00 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

MS-2 No Bid $2.05 per gallon or $498.15 per gallon $2.26 per gallon or $549.18 per ton $2.20 per gallon $.20 per mile per gallon

HFRS-2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.05 per gallon $.20 per mile per gallon

RC-250 3.25 per gallon $3.4843 per gallon $3.35 per gallon or $837.50 per ton $3.56 per gallon or $890.0 per ton No Bid No Bid

AC-5 $2.55 per gallon $2.7900 per gallon $2.77 per gallon or $637.10 per ton $2.98 per gallon or $685.40 per ton $530.00 per ton $32.00 per mile per ton

AC-10 $2.45 per gallon $2.6900 per gallon $2.77 per gallon or $637.10 per ton $2.98 per gallon or $685.40 per ton $520.00 per ton $32.00 per mile per ton

AC-15P 3% Polymer No Bid No Bid No Bid $655.00 per ton $32.00 per mile per ton

AC-15XP 2% Polymer No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

MC-30 $3.10 per gallon $3.3400 per gallon $3.85 per gallon or $933.30 per ton $4.06 per gallon or $1047.48 per ton No Bid No Bid

CRS-1P No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.45 per gallon $.35 per mile per gallon

P2 Prime No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

P2 Prime Emulsifies Concentrate No Bid No Bid No Bid

Diluted AEP: 40% H2O/60% product No Bid

$1.55 per gallon** or $390.60 per 

ton** $1.76 per gallon or $443.52 per ton $1.62 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

Diluted AEP:  50% H2O/50% product No Bid

$1.45 per gallon** or $365.40 per 

ton** $1.66 per gallon or $418.32 per ton $1.40 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

Diluted AEP:  60% H2O/40% product No Bid $1.35 per gallon** or $340.20 per ton $1.56 per gallon or $393.12 per ton $1.18 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

CWE/CWP2 Emulsified Asphalt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rate of Demurrage per hour $85.00 per hour $80.00 per hour after 2 free hours $80.00 per hour after 2 free hours

Minimum Order, if applicable

On MC 30 and RC 250 only 1,000 

gallon minimum 5000 gallons  21 tons

No minimum order, however freight is 

based on a full transport load (approx. 

5,500 gallons or 24 tons), even if a full 

load is not ordered

Other Fees:

Freight figured on full transport loads.  

Minimum freight charge of 5,500 

gallons.  $450 overnight fee.  $75 

diversion fee.  Pump charge of $100.  

Demurrage 2 hours free then $85 per 

hour as stated above.  All pricing in 

gallons.  Only tanker transports to be 

used and no belly dumps or tandems as 

referred to on page 16, item 1, letter G.  

Return loads will be billed at 1/2 

outgoing freight.  Diluted loads cannot 

be returned.  Contact Kody Kohl, Cell 

512-517-5998 for return loads. Loads 

canceled in transit will be billed at 

cost.

Diluted loads cannot be returned.  Call 

24 hours before delivery time to cancel 

the delivery

Pump charge is $90.00 per load.  

Return freight is one-half of the 

outgoing tariff.  Delivery time is 24 

hours following receipt of the order.

CRS-2+ $2.15 per gallon CRS-2+ $2.29 per gallon delivered

CRS-2P $2.30 per galon CRS-2P $2.44 per gallon delivered
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RFB-2019-002

Road Materials

RB Pct. 3

Vulcan 37 Mining

Arcosa Aggregates (formerly 

Trinity Materials) Alvarado Sand and Gravel

Martin Marietta Materials, 

Inc.  Rattler Rock, Inc Texas Bit Big City Crushed Concrete JLB Contracting Road Rescue

Kevin Vaughn - 210-524-

3577 - 

vaughnkm@vcmmail.com

Kevin Boyd - 817-341-8744 - 

kboyd@37bp.com

Bryan Gay - 972-207-2680 - 

bryan.gay@arcosa.com

Pedro Martinez - 817-938-

5001 - 

pedro@alvaradosand.com

David Sobczak - 405-312-

3894 - 

David.Sobczak@martinmari

etta.com

 Charles Davis - 254-874-

5282 - 

rattlerrock@yahoo.com 

Chris Michael - 214-741-

3531 - 

chris.michael@texasbit.com

Josh Hylkema - 972-243-5820 

- josh@bccclp.com

Terry Patterson - 817-261-

2991 - 

tpatterson@jlbcontracting.co

m

Terry Applewhite - 817-805-

0644 - 

lapplewhite@roadrescueasph

alt.com

CRUSHED LIMESTONE

Type D, Grade 3 No Bid $21.00 per ton picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type D, Grade 4

$22.00 per ton picked up / 

$40.55 per ton delivered to 

Italy and $37.86 per ton 

delivered to Maypearl $21.00 per ton picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type D, Grade 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fine D

$8.00 picked up / $26.55 per 

ton delivered to Italy and 

$23.86 per tondelivered to 

Maypearl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):  Manufactured 

Sand No Bid $10.00 per ton picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):  1" (#57) Crushed 

Limestone No Bid $12.00 per ton picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations Weatherford, TX Palo Pinto, TX  76484 Blum, TX

CRUSHED LIMESTONE FLEX BASE

Type A, Grade 1

$8.00 picked up / $40.55 per 

ton delivered ti Italy and 

$37.86 per ton delivered to 

Maypearl  $8.00 per ton picked up

$12.50 per ton picked up / 

$23.25 delivered - Grade 1 and 

Grade 2 No Bid

$8.00 per ton picked up / 

$26.00 per ton delivered $6.00 per ton picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type A, Grade 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

$5.75 per ton picked up / 

$5.95 per mile delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations Weatherford, TX Palo Pinto, TX  76484

Wills Point 11630 CR 314, 

Terrell, TX 75161

Italy 52 miles - Maypearl 37 

miles - Blum, TX  76627 Chico, TX Blum, TX

CRUSHED CONCRETE FLEX BASE

Type D, Grade 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$9.00 per ton picked up / 

$22.25 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid

Type D, Grade 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$9.00 per ton picked up / 

$22.25 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations

Grade 1 and 2 - 11143 

Goodnight Lane, Dallas, TX  

75229 or 1005 Forest Ave., 

Dallas, TX  75215
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RFB-2019-002

Road Materials

RB Pct. 3

Vulcan 37 Mining

Arcosa Aggregates (formerly 

Trinity Materials) Alvarado Sand and Gravel

Martin Marietta Materials, 

Inc.  Rattler Rock, Inc Texas Bit Big City Crushed Concrete JLB Contracting Road Rescue

Kevin Vaughn - 210-524-

3577 - 

vaughnkm@vcmmail.com

Kevin Boyd - 817-341-8744 - 

kboyd@37bp.com

Bryan Gay - 972-207-2680 - 

bryan.gay@arcosa.com

Pedro Martinez - 817-938-

5001 - 

perdro@alvaradosand.com

David Sobczak - 405-312-

3894 - 

David.Sobczak@martinmari

etta.com

 Charles Davis - 254-874-

5282 - 

rattlerrock@yahoo.com 

Chris Michael - 214-741-

3531 - 

chris.michael@texasbit.com

Josh Hylkema - 972-243-5820 

- josh@bccclp.com

Terry Patterson - 817-261-

2991 - 

tpatterson@jlbcontracting.co

m

Terry Applewhite - 817-805-

0644 - 

lapplewhite@roadrescueasph

alt.com

LIGHTWEIGHT AGGREGATE

Type L, Grade 3 No Bid No Bid

$55.00 per ton picked up / 

$62.50 per ton delivered to 

Italy and $65.50 delivered to 

Maypearl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type L, Grade 4 No Bid No Bid

$55.00 per ton picked up / 

$62.50 per ton delivered to 

Italy and $65.50 delivered to 

Maypearl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type L, Grade5 No Bid No Bid

$55.00 per ton picked up / 

$52.50 per ton delivered to 

Italy and $55.50 delivered to 

Maypearl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): Blue Base No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$5.00 per ton picked up (when 

available) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): 1" x 3" Oversize No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$7.00 per ton picked up (when 

available) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): 3" x 5" Oversize No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$7.00 per ton picked up (when 

available) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations Streetman, TX Blum, TX

WASHED PEA GRAVEL

Type A, Grade 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type A, Grade 5 No Bid No Bid

$8.00 per ton picked up / 

$13.50 delivered

$10.00 per ton picked up/ 

$5.95 per mile delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations

Cottonwood 18400 Pilgrim 

Road, Rosser, TX 75157

58 miles Italy -  43 miles 

Maypearl - Koppell Plant -                    

Trinity Materials, 2606 TX-

174, Koppel, TX  76652

PIT RUN GRAVEL

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations

RIP RAP

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$23.00 per ton picked up / 

$5.95 per mile delivered

$18.00 per ton picked up / 

$41.80 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations Chico
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RFB-2019-002

Road Materials

RB Pct. 3

Vulcan 37 Mining

Arcosa Aggregates (formerly 

Trinity Materials) Alvarado Sand and Gravel

Martin Marietta Materials, 

Inc.  Rattler Rock, Inc Texas Bit Big City Crushed Concrete JLB Contracting Road Rescue

Kevin Vaughn - 210-524-

3577 - 

vaughnkm@vcmmail.com

Kevin Boyd - 817-341-8744 - 

kboyd@37bp.com

Bryan Gay - 972-207-2680 - 

bryan.gay@arcosa.com

Pedro Martinez - 817-938-

5001 - 

perdro@alvaradosand.com

David Sobczak - 405-312-

3894 - 

David.Sobczak@martinmari

etta.com

 Charles Davis - 254-874-

5282 - 

rattlerrock@yahoo.com 

Chris Michael - 214-741-

3531 - 

chris.michael@texasbit.com

Josh Hylkema - 972-243-5820 

- josh@bccclp.com

Terry Patterson - 817-261-

2991 - 

tpatterson@jlbcontracting.co

m

Terry Applewhite - 817-805-

0644 - 

lapplewhite@roadrescueasph

alt.com

HOT MIX, COLD LAID ASPHALT 

CONCRETE

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$85.00 per ton picked up /  

$.32 per ton per mile delivered 

- Sunnyvale Plant Only No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):

Pick up Locations

HOT MIX ASPHALT

Type D, Hot Mix No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$65.00 per ton picked up - 50 

ton minium / $.32 per ton per 

mile delivered - Alvarado, 

Sunnyvale, Terrell Plant No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):  SSM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$62.00 per ton picked up / 

$.32 per ton per mile delivered 

- Terrell Plant Only No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations

CRUSHED ASPHALT

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$9.00 per ton picked up / 

$22.25 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):

Pick up Locations

11143 Goodnight Lane, 

Dallas, TX  75229 - Plant 

Only

ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PATCHING 

MATERIAL - 50LB BAG

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$14.00 per bag / $14.00 

delivered

$9.49 picked up / $11.00 per 

page delivered - 62 bag 

minimum

Other items (if applicable):

Pick up Locations Fort Worth, TX Uvalde, Texas

ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PATCHING 

MATERIAL - STOCKPILE

$105.00 per ton / $.32 per mile 

per ton delivered - Alvarado 

and Terrell Plant Only

$100.00 per ton picked up / 

$108.00 per ton delivered

$121.91 per cubic yard - Full 

Truck Load Minimum

Other items (if applicable):

Pick up Locations Fort Worth, TX Uvalde, Texas
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RFB-2019-002

Road Materials

RB Pct. 3

RFB-2019-001 Hauling Road Material

CKJ Transport of North Texas

DIESEL FUEL PRICE PRICE PER MILE END DUMP BELLY DUMP FLAT BED DELIVERY

MINIMUM DELIVERY 

AMOUNT

$1.50-$1.99 5.86$                                      15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$2.00-$2.49 5.86$                                      15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$2.50-$2.99 5.86$                                      15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$3.00-$3.49 5.86$                                      15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$3.50-$3.99 5.86$                                      15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$4.00-$4.49 5.86$                                      15+ 0 No 26 Tons

CKJ Transport Of North Texas

1650 W Virginia ST.

Suite 200

McKinney, TX 75069

972-808-7660

Alvarado Sand & Gravel, LLC

DIESEL FUEL PRICE PRICE PER MILE END DUMP BELLY DUMP FLAT BED DELIVERY

MINIMUM DELIVERY 

AMOUNT

$1.50-$1.99

$2.00-$2.49

$2.50-$2.99

$3.00-$3.49 $5.95

$3.50-$3.99

$4.00-$4.49

Alvarado Sand & Gravel, LLC

4372 135 W

Alvarado, TX 76009

817-938-5001
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RFB-2019-002

Road Materials

RB Pct. 3

Wright Asphalt Cleveland Asphalt Ergon Asphalt

Description Plant Pick Up Per Unit of Measure

FOB Precinct / Job Site Mileage 

Rate / Unit of Measure Price Plant Pick Up Per Unit of Measure

FOB Precinct / Job Site Mileage 

Rate / Unit of Measure Price Plant Pick Up Per Unit of Measure

FOB Precinct / Job Site Mileage 

Rate / Unit of Measure Price

CRS-2 $1.77 per gallon $2.0043 per gallon $1.95 per gallon or $473.85 per ton $2.16 per gallon or $524.88 per ton $2.00 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

CRS-2H No Bid $1.95 per gallon or $473.85 per ton $2.16 per gallon or $524.88 per ton $2.00 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

MS-2 No Bid $2.05 per gallon or $498.15 per gallon $2.26 per gallon or $549.18 per ton $2.20 per gallon $.20 per mile per gallon

HFRS-2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.05 per gallon $.20 per mile per gallon

RC-250 3.25 per gallon $3.4843 per gallon $3.35 per gallon or $837.50 per ton $3.56 per gallon or $890.0 per ton No Bid No Bid

AC-5 $2.55 per gallon $2.7900 per gallon $2.77 per gallon or $637.10 per ton $2.98 per gallon or $685.40 per ton $530.00 per ton $32.00 per mile per ton

AC-10 $2.45 per gallon $2.6900 per gallon $2.77 per gallon or $637.10 per ton $2.98 per gallon or $685.40 per ton $520.00 per ton $32.00 per mile per ton

AC-15P 3% Polymer No Bid No Bid No Bid $655.00 per ton $32.00 per mile per ton

AC-15XP 2% Polymer No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

MC-30 $3.10 per gallon $3.3400 per gallon $3.85 per gallon or $933.30 per ton $4.06 per gallon or $1047.48 per ton No Bid No Bid

CRS-1P No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.45 per gallon $.35 per mile per gallon

P2 Prime No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

P2 Prime Emulsifies Concentrate No Bid No Bid No Bid

Diluted AEP: 40% H2O/60% product No Bid

$1.55 per gallon** or $390.60 per 

ton** $1.76 per gallon or $443.52 per ton $1.62 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

Diluted AEP:  50% H2O/50% product No Bid

$1.45 per gallon** or $365.40 per 

ton** $1.66 per gallon or $418.32 per ton $1.40 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

Diluted AEP:  60% H2O/40% product No Bid $1.35 per gallon** or $340.20 per ton $1.56 per gallon or $393.12 per ton $1.18 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

CWE/CWP2 Emulsified Asphalt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rate of Demurrage per hour $85.00 per hour $80.00 per hour after 2 free hours $80.00 per hour after 2 free hours

Minimum Order, if applicable

On MC 30 and RC 250 only 1,000 

gallon minimum 5000 gallons  21 tons

No minimum order, however freight is 

based on a full transport load (approx. 

5,500 gallons or 24 tons), even if a full 

load is not ordered

Other Fees:

Freight figured on full transport loads.  

Minimum freight charge of 5,500 

gallons.  $450 overnight fee.  $75 

diversion fee.  Pump charge of $100.  

Demurrage 2 hours free then $85 per 

hour as stated above.  All pricing in 

gallons.  Only tanker transports to be 

used and no belly dumps or tandems as 

referred to on page 16, item 1, letter G.  

Return loads will be billed at 1/2 

outgoing freight.  Diluted loads cannot 

be returned.  Contact Kody Kohl, Cell 

512-517-5998 for return loads. Loads 

canceled in transit will be billed at cost.

Diluted loads cannot be returned.  Call 

24 hours before delivery time to cancel 

the delivery

Pump charge is $90.00 per load.  

Return freight is one-half of the 

outgoing tariff.  Delivery time is 24 

hours following receipt of the order.

CRS-2+ $2.15 per gallon CRS-2+ $2.29 per gallon delivered

CRS-2P $2.30 per galon CRS-2P $2.44 per gallon delivered
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RFB-2019-002

Road Materials

RB Precinct 4

Vulcan 37 Mining

Arcosa Aggregates 

(formerly Trinity 

Materials)

Alvarado Sand and 

Gravel

Martin Marietta 

Materials, Inc.  Rattler Rock, Inc Texas Bit

Big City Crushed 

Concrete JLB Contracting Road Rescue

Kevin Vaughn - 210-524-

3577 - 

vaughnkm@vcmmail.com

Kevin Boyd - 817-341-

8744 - kboyd@37bp.com

Bryan Gay - 972-207-

2680 - 

bryan.gay@arcosa.com

Pedro Martinez - 817-938-

5001 - 

pedro@alvaradosand.com

David Sobczak - 405-312-

3894 - 

David.Sobczak@martinm

arietta.com

 Charles Davis - 254-874-

5282 - 

rattlerrock@yahoo.com 

Chris Michael - 214-741-

3531 - 

chris.michael@texasbit.co

m

Josh Hylkema - 972-243-

5820 - josh@bccclp.com

Terry Patterson - 817-261-

2991 - 

tpatterson@jlbcontractin

g.com

Terry Applewhite - 817-

805-0644 - 

lapplewhite@roadrescuea

sphalt.com

CRUSHED LIMESTONE

Type D, Grade 3 No Bid $21.00 picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type D, Grade 4

$22.00 per ton picked up / 

$37.18 per ton delivered $21.00 picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type D, Grade 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fine D

$8.00 picked up / $23.18 

per ton delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):  Manufactured 

Sand No Bid $10.00 per ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):  1" (#57) Crushed 

Limestone No Bid $12.00 per ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations Weatherford, TX Palo Pinto, TX  76484

62 miles - Blum, TX  

76627

CRUSHED LIMESTONE FLEX BASE

Type A, Grade 1

$10.00 picked up / $37.18 

per ton delivered $8.00 per ton

$12.50 per ton picked up / 

$23.25 delivered - Grade 1 

and Grade 2 No Bid

$8.00 per ton picked up / 

$26.00 per ton delivered $6.00 per ton picked up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type A, Grade 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid

$5.75 per ton picked up / 

$5.95 per mile delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations Weatherford, TX Palo Pinto, TX  76484

Wills Point 11630 CR 314, 

Terrell, TX 75161

48 miles - Blum, TX  

76627 Chico, TX Blum, TX

CRUSHED CONCRETE FLEX BASE

Type D, Grade 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$9.00 per ton picked up / 

$19.50 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid

Type D, Grade 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$9.00 per ton picked up / 

$19.50 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations

Grade 1 and 2 - 11143 

Goodnight Lane, Dallas, 

TX  75229 or 1005 Forest 

Ave., Dallas, TX  75215
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RFB-2019-002

Road Materials

RB Precinct 4

Vulcan 37 Mining

Arcosa Aggregates 

(formerly Trinity 

Materials)

Alvarado Sand and 

Gravel

Martin Marietta 

Materials, Inc.  Rattler Rock, Inc Texas Bit

Big City Crushed 

Concrete JLB Contracting Road Rescue

Kevin Vaughn - 210-524-

3577 - 

vaughnkm@vcmmail.com

Kevin Boyd - 817-341-

8744 - kboyd@37bp.com

Bryan Gay - 972-207-

2680 - 

bryan.gay@arcosa.com

Pedro Martinez - 817-938-

5001 - 

perdro@alvaradosand.co

m

David Sobczak - 405-312-

3894 - 

David.Sobczak@martinm

arietta.com

 Charles Davis - 254-874-

5282 - 

rattlerrock@yahoo.com 

Chris Michael - 214-741-

3531 - 

chris.michael@texasbit.co

m

Josh Hylkema - 972-243-

5820 - josh@bccclp.com

Terry Patterson - 817-261-

2991 - 

tpatterson@jlbcontractin

g.com

Terry Applewhite - 817-

805-0644 - 

lapplewhite@roadrescuea

sphalt.com

LIGHTWEIGHT AGGREGATE

Type L, Grade 3 No Bid No Bid

$55.00 per ton picked up / 

$64.00 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type L, Grade 4 No Bid No Bid

$55.00 per ton picked up / 

$64.00 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type L, Grade5 No Bid No Bid

$45.00 per ton picked up / 

$54.00 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): Blue Base No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$5.00 per ton picked up 

(when available) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): 1" x 3" Oversize No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$7.00 per ton picked up 

(when available) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): 3" x 5" Oversize No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$7.00 per ton picked up 

(when available) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations Streetman, TX Blum, TX

WASHED PEA GRAVEL

Type A, Grade 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type A, Grade 5 No Bid No Bid

$8.00 per ton picked up / 

$13.50 delivered

$10.00 per ton picked up/ 

$5.95 per mile delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations

Cottonwood 18400 Pilgrim 

Road, Rosser, TX 75157

52 miles - Koppell Plant - 

Trinity Materials, 2606 TX-

174, Koppel, TX  76652

PIT RUN GRAVEL

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations

RIP RAP

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$23.00 per ton picked up / 

$5.95 per mile delivered

$18.00 per ton picked up / 

$41.80 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations Blum, TX Chico, TX
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HOT MIX, COLD LAID ASPHALT 

CONCRETE

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$85.00 per ton picked up /  

$.32 per ton per mile 

delivered - Sunnyvale Plant 

Only No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations

Vulcan 37 Mining

Arcosa Aggregates 

(formerly Trinity 

Materials)

Alvarado Sand and 

Gravel

Martin Marietta 

Materials, Inc.  Rattler Rock, Inc Texas Bit

Big City Crushed 

Concrete JLB Contracting Road Rescue

Kevin Vaughn - 210-524-

3577 - 

vaughnkm@vcmmail.com

Kevin Boyd - 817-341-

8744 - kboyd@37bp.com

Bryan Gay - 972-207-

2680 - 

bryan.gay@arcosa.com

Pedro Martinez - 817-938-

5001 - 

perdro@alvaradosand.co

m

David Sobczak - 405-312-

3894 - 

David.Sobczak@martinm

arietta.com

 Charles Davis - 254-874-

5282 - 

rattlerrock@yahoo.com 

Chris Michael - 214-741-

3531 - 

chris.michael@texasbit.co

m

Josh Hylkema - 972-243-

5820 - josh@bccclp.com

Terry Patterson - 817-261-

2991 - 

tpatterson@jlbcontractin

g.com

Terry Applewhite - 817-

805-0644 - 

lapplewhite@roadrescuea

sphalt.com

HOT MIX ASPHALT

Type D, Hot Mix No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$65.00 per ton picked up - 

50 ton minium / $.32 per 

ton per mile delivered - 

Alvarado, Sunnyvale, 

Terrell Plant No Bid No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable):  SSM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$62.00 per ton picked up / 

$.32 per ton per mile 

delivered - Terrell Plant 

Only No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations

CRUSHED ASPHALT

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$9.00 per ton picked up / 

$19.50 per ton delivered No Bid No Bid

Other items (if applicable): No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations

11143 Goodnight Lane, 

Dallas, TX  75229 - Plant 

Only

ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PATCHING 

MATERIAL - 50LB BAG

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$14.00 per bag / $14.00 

delivered

$9.49 picked up / $11.00 

per page delivered - 62 bag 

minimum

Other items (if applicable): No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations Fort Worth, TX Uvalde, TX

ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PATCHING 

MATERIAL - STOCKPILE

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$105.00 per ton / $.32 per 

mile per ton delivered - 

Alvarado and Terrell Plant 

Only No Bid

$100.00 per ton picked up / 

$108.00 per ton delivered

$121.91 per cubic yard - 

Full Truck Load Minimum

Other items (if applicable): No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pick up Locations Fort Worth, TX Uvalde, TX
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RFB-2019-001 Hauling Road Material

CKJ Transport of North Texas

DIESEL FUEL PRICE PRICE PER MILE END DUMP BELLY DUMP FLAT BED DELIVERY

MINIMUM DELIVERY 

AMOUNT

$1.50-$1.99 5.86$                                 15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$2.00-$2.49 5.86$                                 15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$2.50-$2.99 5.86$                                 15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$3.00-$3.49 5.86$                                 15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$3.50-$3.99 5.86$                                 15+ 0 No 26 Tons

$4.00-$4.49 5.86$                                 15+ 0 No 26 Tons

CKJ Transport Of North Texas

1650 W Virginia ST.

Suite 200

McKinney, TX 75069

972-808-7660

Alvarado Sand & Gravel, LLC

DIESEL FUEL PRICE PRICE PER MILE END DUMP BELLY DUMP FLAT BED DELIVERY

MINIMUM DELIVERY 

AMOUNT

$1.50-$1.99

$2.00-$2.49

$2.50-$2.99
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$3.00-$3.49 $5.95

$3.50-$3.99

$4.00-$4.49

Alvarado Sand & Gravel, LLC

4372 135 W

Alvarado, TX 76009

817-938-5001

Wright Asphalt Cleveland Asphalt Ergon Asphalt

Description

Plant Pick Up Per Unit of 

Measure

FOB Precinct / Job Site 

Mileage Rate / Unit of 

Measure Price

Plant Pick Up Per Unit of 

Measure

FOB Precinct / Job Site 

Mileage Rate / Unit of 

Measure Price

Plant Pick Up Per Unit of 

Measure

FOB Precinct / Job Site 

Mileage Rate / Unit of 

Measure Price

CRS-2 $1.77 per gallon $2.0043 per gallon

$1.95 per gallon or $473.85 per 

ton

$2.16 per gallon or $524.88 per 

ton $2.00 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

CRS-2H No Bid

$1.95 per gallon or $473.85 per 

ton

$2.16 per gallon or $524.88 per 

ton $2.00 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

MS-2 No Bid

$2.05 per gallon or $498.15 per 

gallon

$2.26 per gallon or $549.18 per 

ton $2.20 per gallon $.20 per mile per gallon

HFRS-2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.05 per gallon $.20 per mile per gallon

RC-250 3.25 per gallon $3.4843 per gallon

$3.35 per gallon or $837.50 per 

ton $3.56 per gallon or $890.0 per ton No Bid No Bid

AC-5 $2.55 per gallon $2.7900 per gallon

$2.77 per gallon or $637.10 per 

ton

$2.98 per gallon or $685.40 per 

ton $530.00 per ton $32.00 per mile per ton

AC-10 $2.45 per gallon $2.6900 per gallon

$2.77 per gallon or $637.10 per 

ton

$2.98 per gallon or $685.40 per 

ton $520.00 per ton $32.00 per mile per ton

AC-15P 3% Polymer No Bid No Bid No Bid $655.00 per ton $32.00 per mile per ton

AC-15XP 2% Polymer No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

MC-30 $3.10 per gallon $3.3400 per gallon

$3.85 per gallon or $933.30 per 

ton

$4.06 per gallon or $1047.48 per 

ton No Bid No Bid

CRS-1P No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.45 per gallon $.35 per mile per gallon

P2 Prime No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

P2 Prime Emulsifies Concentrate No Bid No Bid No Bid

Diluted AEP: 40% H2O/60% product No Bid

$1.55 per gallon** or $390.60 per 

ton**

$1.76 per gallon or $443.52 per 

ton $1.62 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

Diluted AEP:  50% H2O/50% product No Bid

$1.45 per gallon** or $365.40 per 

ton**

$1.66 per gallon or $418.32 per 

ton $1.40 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

Diluted AEP:  60% H2O/40% product No Bid

$1.35 per gallon** or $340.20 per 

ton

$1.56 per gallon or $393.12 per 

ton $1.18 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon

CWE/CWP2 Emulsified Asphalt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rate of Demurrage per hour $85.00 per hour $80.00 per hour after 2 free hours $80.00 per hour after 2 free hours

Minimum Order, if applicable

On MC 30 and RC 250 only 1,000 

gallon minimum 5000 gallons  21 tons

No minimum order, however 

freight is based on a full transport 

load (approx. 5,500 gallons or 24 

tons), even if a full load is not 

ordered
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Other Fees:

Freight figured on full transport 

loads.  Minimum freight charge of 

5,500 gallons.  $450 overnight fee.  

$75 diversion fee.  Pump charge of 

$100.  Demurrage 2 hours free 

then $85 per hour as stated above.  

All pricing in gallons.  Only tanker 

transports to be used and no belly 

dumps or tandems as referred to on 

page 16, item 1, letter G.  Return 

loads will be billed at 1/2 outgoing 

freight.  Diluted loads cannot be 

returned.  Contact Kody Kohl, Cell 

512-517-5998 for return loads. 

Loads canceled in transit will be 

billed at cost.

Diluted loads cannot be returned.  

Call 24 hours before delivery time 

to cancel the delivery

Pump charge is $90.00 per load.  

Return freight is one-half of the 

outgoing tariff.  Delivery time is 24 

hours following receipt of the 

order.

CRS-2+ $2.15 per gallon CRS-2+ $2.29 per gallon delivered

CRS-2P $2.30 per galon CRS-2P $2.44 per gallon delivered
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