Wright Asphalt

RFB-2019-003

Annual Contract for
Emulsified Asphalts

Cleveland Asphalt

Ergon Asphalt

Description

Plant Pick Up Per Unit of

FOB Precinct / Job Site Mileage

Plant Pick Up Per Unit of

FOB Precinct / Job Site Mileage

Plant Pick Up Per Unit of

FOB Precinct / Job Site Mileage

Measure Rate / Unit of Measure Price Measure Rate / Unit of Measure Price Measure Rate / Unit of Measure Price
CRS-2 $1.77 per gallon $2.0043 per gallon $1.95 per gallon or $473.85 per ton ~ [$2.16 per gallon or $524.88 per ton  |$2.00 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon
CRS-2H No Bid $1.95 per gallon or $473.85 per ton ~ [$2.16 per gallon or $524.88 per ton  |$2.00 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon
MS-2 No Bid $2.05 per gallon or $498.15 per gallon |$2.26 per gallon or $549.18 per ton ~ [$2.20 per gallon $.20 per mile per gallon
HFRS-2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.05 per gallon $.20 per mile per gallon
RC-250 3.25 per gallon $3.4843 per gallon $3.35 per gallon or $837.50 per ton  |$3.56 per gallon or $890.0 per ton No Bid No Bid
AC-5 $2.55 per gallon $2.7900 per gallon $2.77 per gallon or $637.10 per ton ~ |$2.98 per gallon or $685.40 per ton  [$530.00 per ton $32.00 per mile per ton
AC-10 $2.45 per gallon $2.6900 per gallon $2.77 per gallon or $637.10 per ton ~ |$2.98 per gallon or $685.40 per ton  [$520.00 per ton $32.00 per mile per ton
AC-15P 3%
Polymer No Bid No Bid No Bid $655.00 per ton $32.00 per mile per ton
AC-15XP 2%
Polymer No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MC-30 $3.10 per gallon $3.3400 per gallon $3.85 per gallon or $933.30 per ton  |$4.06 per gallon or $1047.48 per ton [No Bid No Bid
CRS-1P No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.45 per gallon $.35 per mile per gallon
P2 Prime No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
P2 Prime
Emulsifies
Concentrate |No Bid No Bid No Bid
Diluted AEP:
40% H20/60% $1.55 per gallon** or $390.60 per
product No Bid ton** $1.76 per gallon or $443.52 per ton  |$1.62 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon
Diluted AEP:
50% H20/50% $1.45 per gallon** or $365.40 per
product No Bid ton** $1.66 per gallon or $418.32 per ton  [$1.40 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon
Diluted AEP:
60% H20/40%
product No Bid $1.35 per gallon** or $340.20 per ton [$1.56 per gallon or $393.12 per ton  |$1.18 per gallon $.14 per mile per gallon
CWE/CWP2
Emulsified
Asphalt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rate of
Demurrage per
hour $85.00 per hour $80.00 per hour after 2 free hours $80.00 per hour after 2 free hours
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RFB-2019-003

Annual Contract for
Emulsified Asphalts

Minimum
Order, if
applicable

On MC 30 and RC 250 only 1,000
gallon minimum

5000 gallons 21 tons

NO mInimum order, NOWEVer Treight 1s
based on a full transport load (approx.
5,500 gallons or 24 tons), even if a full
load is not ordered

Other Fees:

Freight figured on full transport loads.
Minimum freight charge of 5,500
gallons. $450 overnight fee. $75
diversion fee. Pump charge of $100.
Demurrage 2 hours free then $85 per
hour as stated above. All pricing in
gallons. Only tanker transports to be
used and no belly dumps or tandems
as referred to on page 16, item 1, letter
G. Return loads will be billed at 1/2
outgoing freight. Diluted loads cannot
be returned. Contact Kody Kohl, Cell
512-517-5998 for return loads. Loads
canceled in transit will be billed at
cost.

Diluted loads cannot be returned. Call
24 hours before delivery time to cancel
the delivery

Pump charge is $90.00 per load.
Return freight is one-half of the
outgoing tariff. Delivery time is 24
hours following receipt of the order.

CRS-2+ $2.15 per gallon

CRS-2+ $2.29 per gallon delivered

CRS-2P $2.30 per galon

CRS-2P $2.44 per gallon delivered
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