
RB-2017-006

Annual Contract For Emulsified Asphalt

 Wright Asphalt Products Co. 

 Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, 

Inc.  Cleveland Asphalt 

CRS-2H Price Per Ton 

(Delivered to PCT)

Precinct 1 Palmer $362.56 $374.56 $364.56

Precinct 2 Ennis $362.56 $374.56 $364.56

Precinct 3 Italy $361.30 $374.56 $364.56

Precinct 3 Maypearl $361.30 $374.56 $364.56

Precinct 4 Midlothian $361.30 $374.56 $364.56

CRS-2H Price Per Ton              

(Picked Up)  $319.80 $345.00 $314.60

CRS-2 Price Per Ton 

(Delivered)

Precinct 1 Palmer $362.56 $374.56 $364.56

Precinct 2 Ennis $362.56 $374.56 $364.56

Precinct 3 Italy $361.30 $374.56 $364.56

Precinct 3 Maypearl $361.30 $374.56 $364.56

Precinct 4 Midlothian $361.30 $374.56 $364.56

CRS-2  Price Per Ton                

(Picked Up) $319.80 $345.00 $314.60

MS-2 Price Per Ton 

(Delivered) NO BID $563.75 $390.16

MS-2 Price Per Ton                  

(Picked Up) NO BID $520.00 $340.20

AE-P Prime Price Per Ton 

(Delivered)  NO BID $549.56 $529.81

AE-P Prime Price Per Ton  

(Picked Up) NO BID $520.00 $479.85

Demurrage Charge  $60 hr. after the first 2 hrs.  $80 hr. after the first 2hrs. $80 hr. after the first 2 hrs.

Pump and Hose Charge $100.00 per load  $90.00 per load  No Charge  

Delivery Time & Location

24 hrs. Notice - 1505 Custer Road, 

Brownwood, TX  76801

24 hrs. Notice - Austin and 

Saginaw  Shepard, Texas  

Minimun Orders

Freight based on minimum of 22.5 

tons

 No minimum order.  Freight based 

on full transport - Approx. 24 tons 5000 gallons or 22 tons

Cancellation Policy 

Loads canceled in transport will be 

billed at cost. Return loads will be 

billed an additional 1/2 outgoing 

freight rate. 

Varies with circumstance.  Return 

freight is 1/2 of the outgoing tariff

Returns for product only - Not Freight 

- Call by midnight to cancel orders - 

Dispatcher 713-206-8471

(Notify Kody Kohl, Cell 512-517-

5998, for Return Authorization) 

Diluted Loads can not be returned. 

Layover Fee (if requested): $450 per 

truck per night

*Optional Products Offered*

 Wright Asphalt Products 

Co. 

TR FOG Price Per Ton 

(Delivered)

Precinct 1 Palmer 413.21$                                        

Precinct 2 Ennis 413.21$                                        

Precinct 3 Italy  $                                        411.95 

Precinct 3 Maypearl  $                                        411.95 

Precinct 4 Midlothian  $                                        411.95 

TR FOG Price Per Ton                  

(Picked Up) 

Precinct 1 Palmer 370.45$                                        

Precinct 2 Ennis 370.45$                                        

Precinct 3 Italy 370.45$                                        
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Precinct 3 Maypearl 370.45$                                        

Precinct 4 Midlothian 370.45$                                        

 Ergon Asphalt & 

Emulsions, Inc. 

CRS-2+ Price Per Ton          

(Delivered)

Precinct 1 Palmer 422.26$                                        

Precinct 2 Ennis 422.26$                                        

Precinct 3 Italy  $                                        422.26 

Precinct 3 Maypearl  $                                        422.26 

Precinct 4 Midlothian  $                                        422.26 

CRS-2+ Price Per Ton                    

(Picked Up)

Precinct 1 Palmer 392.70$                                        

Precinct 2 Ennis 392.70$                                        

Precinct 3 Italy 392.70$                                        

Precinct 3 Maypearl 392.70$                                        

Precinct 4 Midlothian 392.70$                                        

CRS-2P Price Per Ton                    

(Delivered)

Precinct 1 Palmer 469.86$                                        

Precinct 2 Ennis 469.86$                                        

Precinct 3 Italy 469.86$                                        

Precinct 3 Maypearl 469.86$                                        

Precinct 4 Midlothian 469.86$                                        

CRS-2P Price Per Ton                                           

(Picked Up)

Precinct 1 Palmer 440.30$                                        

Precinct 2 Ennis 440.30$                                        

Precinct 3 Italy 440.30$                                        

Precinct 3 Maypearl 440.30$                                        

Precinct 4 Midlothian 440.30$                                        
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