
Grade 4
Q ROBERTS TRUCKING PCT. #1 PCT. #2 PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4

PALMER ENNIS ITALY MAYPEARL MIDLOTHIAN
PICKED UP - PER TON 10.00$       10.00$   10.00$   10.00$             10.00$                  
DELIVERED TO PCT YARD - PER TON 14.35$       14.35$   19.95$   19.95$             19.95$                  
PER MILE 0.20$         0.20$     0.20$     0.20$               0.20$                    
MILES TO PCT YARD 14 22 40 38 37

RB-2016-009
WASHED PEA GRAVEL TYPE A, GRADE 4

EXPIRES 12/31/2016 (W/ (2) 1 YEAR RENEWALS)
PRICE BY LOCATION



Grade 5
Q ROBERTS TRUCKING PCT. #1 PCT. #2 PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4

PALMER ENNIS ITALY MAYPEARL MIDLOTHIAN
PICKED UP - PER TON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DELIVERED TO PCT YARD - PER TON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PER MILE
MILES TO PCT YARD

Grade 5
ALVARADO SAND AND GRAVEL PCT. #1 PCT. #2 PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4

PALMER ENNIS ITALY MAYPEARL MIDLOTHIAN
PICKED UP - PER TON 8.00$         8.00$     8.00$     8.00$               8.00$                    
DELIVERED TO PCT YARD - PER TON 13.63$       12.07$   15.76$   16.92$             16.54$                  
PER MILE 0.19$         0.20$     0.20$     0.20$               0.20$                    
MILES TO PCT YARD 29 21 40 46 44

Grade 5
TRINITY MATERIALS PCT. #1 PCT. #2 PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
*COTTONWOOD PLANT PALMER ENNIS ITALY MAYPEARL MIDLOTHIAN
PICKED UP - PER TON 8.00$         8.00$     8.00$     8.00$               8.00$                    
DELIVERED TO PCT YARD - PER TON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PER MILE
MILES TO PCT YARD

PRICE BY LOCATION

RB-2016-009
WASHED PEA GRAVEL TYPE A, GRADE 5

EXPIRES 12/31/2016 (W/ (2) 1 YEAR RENEWALS)
PRICE BY LOCATION

PRICE BY LOCATION
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