RB-2016-008

RECYCLED CONCRETE FLEX BASE TYPE D, GRADE 2

EXPIRES 12/31/2016 (W/ (2) 1 YEAR RENEWALS)

Grade 2 PRICE BY LOCATION

CJ & Son's Trucking PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER | ENNIS | ITALY | MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN

PICKED UP - PER TON $ 750($ 750|% 750|$% 750 | $ 7.50

DELIVERED TO PCT YARD - PER TON $ 13.08| $ 1452 | $ 1632 |$ 15.06 | $ 13.08

PER MILE $ 018|$ 018|$ 018 $ 018 | $ 0.18

MILES TO PCT YARD 31 39 49 42 31

Grade 2 PRICE BY LOCATION

Big City Crushed Concrete PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER | ENNIS | ITALY | MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN

PICKED UP - PER TON $ 750(9$ 750|% 750|$% 750 | $ 7.50

DELIVERED TO PCT YARD - PER TON $ 1750 $ 1750 $ 19.00 | $ 19.00 | $ 16.00

PER MILE

MILES TO PCT YARD 45.9 48.1 54.8 50 36.9

Grade 2 PRICE BY LOCATION

Alvarado Sand and Gravel, LLC PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER | ENNIS | ITALY | MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN

PICKED UP - PER TON NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID

DELIVERED TO PCT YARD - PER TON NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID

PER MILE

MILES TO PCT YARD

Grade 2 PRICE BY LOCATION

Q Roberts Trucking, Inc. PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER | ENNIS | ITALY | MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN

PICKED UP - PER TON $ 750($ 750|% 750|$% 750 | $ 7.50

DELIVERED TO PCT YARD - PER TON $ 1330 $1485|$ 1670 | $ 1545 | $ 13.45

PER MILE $ 019|$ 019|$% 019($ 019 | $ 0.19

MILES TO PCT YARD 30.6 38 48 42 31




RB-2016-008

RECYCLED CONCRETE FLEX BASE TYPE D, GRADE 1

EXPIRES 12/31/2016 (W/ (2) 1 YEAR RENEWALS)

Grade 1 PRICE BY LOCATION
CJ & Son's Trucking PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER | ENNIS | ITALY | MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN
PICKED UP - PER TON $ 750|%$ 750|$ 750(% 750 | $ 7.50
DELIVERED TO PCT YARD - PER TON $ 1308 | $ 1452 $ 1632 $ 15.06 | $ 13.08
PER MILE $ 018 % 018|$ 018($ 018 | $ 0.18
MILES TO PCT YARD 31 39 49 42 31
Grade 1 PRICE BY LOCATION
Big City Crushed Concrete PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER | ENNIS | ITALY | MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN
PICKED UP - PER TON $ 750|$ 750($ 750($ 750 [ $ 7.50
DELIVERED TO PCT YARD - PER TON $ 1750 $ 1750 | $ 19.00 | $ 19.00 | $ 16.00
PER MILE
MILES TO PCT YARD 45.9 48.1 54.8 50 36.9
Grade 1 PRICE BY LOCATION
Alvarado Sand and Gravel, LLC PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER | ENNIS | ITALY | MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN
PICKED UP - PER TON $ 750|$ 750($ 750($ 750 [ $ 7.50
DELIVERED TO PCT YARD - PER TON $ 1300| $ 1451 | $ 16.26 | $ 15.06 | $ 13.03
PER MILE $ 018|$ 018|$ 018 ($ 018 | $ 0.18
MILES TO PCT YARD 29.8 38 475 41 30
Grade 1 PRICE BY LOCATION
Q Roberts Trucking, Inc. PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER | ENNIS | ITALY | MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN
PICKED UP - PER TON $ 750|$ 750($ 750($ 750 [ $ 7.50
DELIVERED TO PCT YARD - PER TON $ 1330| $ 1485 $ 1670 [ $ 1545 | $ 13.45
PER MILE $ 019|% 019|$ 019($ 019 | $ 0.19
MILES TO PCT YARD 30.6 38 48 42 31
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