RB-2016-005
LIMESTONE FLEX BASE TYPE A, GRADE 4
EXPIRES 12/31/2016 (W/ (2) 1 YEAR RENEWALS)

Grade 4 PRICE BY LOCATION

TRINITY MATERIALS INC PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT.#3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER [ ENNIS ITALY | MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN

PICKED UP NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID

DELIVERED TO PCT YARD NOBID [ NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID

PER MILE

MILES TO PCT YARD

*PRICING FOR GRADE 1 AND 2

*LESTER OR WILLS POINT PLANTS

Grade 4 PRICE BY LOCATION

CJ & SONS TRUCKING, INC. PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT.#3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER [ ENNIS ITALY | MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN

PICKED UP $ 650[$ 650|% 650(8$ 650 | $ 6.50

DELIVERED TO PCT YARD $ 1820($ 1892 |$ 1640 | $ 1352 | $ 15.86

PER MILE $ 018($ 018|$ 018( $ 018 | $ 0.18

MILES TO PCT YARD 65 69 55 39 52

Grade 4 PRICE BY LOCATION

ARNOLD CRUSHED STONE PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT.#3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER [ ENNIS ITALY | MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN

PICKED UP $ 550 (% 550|$% 550(8$ 550 | $ 5.50

DELIVERED TO PCT YARD NO BID NO BID | NOBID NO BID NO BID

PER MILE

MILES TO PCT YARD

Grade 4 PRICE BY LOCATION

ALVARADO SAND AND GRAVEL PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT.#3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER [ ENNIS ITALY | MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN

PICKED UP NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID

DELIVERED TO PCT YARD NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID

PER MILE

MILES TO PCT YARD

Grade 4 PRICE BY LOCATION

VULCAN MATERIALS PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT.#3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER [ ENNIS ITALY | MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN

PICKED UP $ 9.00($ 900($ 900]|$ 9.00 | $ 9.00

DELIVERED TO PCT YARD $ 2652[$ 2683 |% 27.05( % 2387 | $ 22.45

PER MILE $ 018($ 018|$ 018 $ 018 ] $ 0.18

MILES TO PCT YARD 99 101 102 84 76




RB-2016-005
LIMESTONE FLEX BASE TYPE A, GRADE 1
EXPIRES 12/31/2016 (W/ (2) 1 YEAR RENEWALS)

Grade 1 PRICE BY LOCATION

TRINITY MATERIALS INC PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER [ ENNIS | ITALY [ MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN

PICKED UP $ 1050 $ 1050 | $ 1050 | $ 1050 | $ 10.50

DELIVERED TO PCT YARD NO BID [ NOBID | NO BID NO BID NO BID

PER MILE

MILES TO PCT YARD

*PRICING FOR GRADE 1 AND 2

*LESTER OR WILLS POINT PLANTS

Grade 1 PRICE BY LOCATION

CJ & SONS TRUCKING, INC. PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER [ ENNIS | ITALY [ MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN

PICKED UP $ 550 [ % 550|$ 550|$ 550 [ $ 5.50

DELIVERED TO PCT YARD $ 1720 $ 17.92| $ 1540 | $ 1252 | $ 14.86

PER MILE $ 018 $ 018|$ 018 $ 018 ] % 0.18

MILES TO PCT YARD 65 69 55 39 52

Grade 1 PRICE BY LOCATION

ARNOLD CRUSHED STONE PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER [ ENNIS | ITALY [ MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN

PICKED UP $ 650 $ 650| % 650 % 6.50 | $ 6.50

DELIVERED TO PCT YARD NO BID | NOBID | NO BID NO BID NO BID

PER MILE

MILES TO PCT YARD

Grade 1 PRICE BY LOCATION

ALVARADO SAND AND GRAVEL PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER [ ENNIS | ITALY [ MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN

PICKED UP $ 6.00($ 600| % 6.00|$ 6.00 | $ 6.00

DELIVERED TO PCT YARD $ 1870 $ 1787 $ 1538 | $ 13271 $ 14.74

PER MILE $ 018|$ 018|$ 0.18( $ 018 ] $ 0.18

MILES TO PCT YARD 69 64.5 51 39.5 47.5

Grade 1 PRICE BY LOCATION

VULCAN MATERIALS PCT.#1 | PCT.#2 | PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4
PALMER [ ENNIS | ITALY [ MAYPEARL | MIDLOTHIAN

PICKED UP $ 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00

DELIVERED TO PCT YARD $ 2752 $2788|$ 2805 $ 2487 | $ 23.45

PER MILE $ 018 $ 018|$ 018 $ 018 ] $ 0.18

MILES TO PCT YARD 99 101 102 84 76




	GRADE 4
	GRADE 1

