Item
Bleach
Bottle
Bottle
Broom
Broom Handle
Brush
Brush
Brush
Styrofoam Cup
Cutlery - Fork
Cutlery - Spoon
Deodorizer
Disinfectant
Disinfectant
Dispenser - Towel Combo
Dust Mop Frame
Dust Mop Handle
Dust Mop Head
Dust Pan
Duster
Duster
Floor Pad
Floor Pad
Floor Pad
Floor Stripper
Glass Cleaner
Gloves
Hand Soap
Hand Soap
Hand Soap
Insect Repellant
Lice Spray
Multi - Purpose Cleaner
Mop
Mop-Bucket Combo
Mop-Bucket Combo
Mop Handle
Mop Handle
Mop Head
Pail
Pine-Sol
Plunger
Powder Cleanser
Powder Cleanser
Rags - T-Shirt
Scrub Brush
Stainless Steel Cleaner
Super Gloss Floor Finish
Toilet Tissue
Toilet Tissue
Toilet Tissue
Towel
Towel
Towel
Towel
Trash Can Liner
Trash Can Liner
Trash Can Liner
Trash Can Liner
Trash Can Liner
Trash Can Liner
Trash Can Liner
Vacuum Bag
Wax Sealer

Delivery Time
Delivery Fee
10% Discount on non-listed items

Janitorial Supplies
G-2015-001
Contract Date

January 1, 2016—Det§g\be(3el, Olr%e

Description
1 gal. - 6 per case
Plastic 32 oz.
Trigger Sprayer - Red/White
24" Black Prolene
Metal Tip 11/8"
Counter - Gray Flagged
Toilet Bowl
10" Plastic Deck - Cream
160z. - 500 per case
Heavy Duty - white - 100 pieces - 10 per case
Heavy Duty - Whie 100 pieces - 10 per case
Time Releaes - Fresh Linen - 7 oz.
Pine Terminator - 1 gal.
Pine-Sol - Orange - 1 gal.
Multi-Fold / Plastic
5"x24
ClipOn
5" x 24" Blue
12" Plastic
Swiffer Refill 10 per box
Swiffer with handle
20" Black Strip 5 per case
20" Red Spray Buff
20" White - 5 per case
Ultr-Strip Floor Stripper - 4 gal. per case
Sparkle Ready To Use - 19 oz.
Poly Food Service Glove - Large - 100 per box

Antibacterial Out of Sight - 800 ml. - 12 bottles per case

Magic - 3/55 . - 4 per case

Dail - 4 gal. per case

Spray - 20 oz.

16 oz. - 12 per case

Maintain Neutral Cleaner - 4 gal. per case
32 oz. - Deck Cotton

With Funnel/Wringer - 35 qt.

35qt.

Clamp on Plastic Head

Clamp on Fiberglass Sidelock

24# Clamp On Cotton - White

14 qgt. Gray Rim

Orange

Toilaflex

Comet Cleaner with Bleach - 32 oz. - 8 per case
With Bleach 21 oz. - 24 cans per case
Colored Mex 10#

Iron Handle

Water Base - 20 oz.

1gal.

500 ct. 96 rolls per case

2-Ply - 12 rolls per case

1-Ply - 1000 sheets - 96 rolls per case
Single Folded Bleached - 4000 per case

8" Natural Towels

Multi Fold - Natural

80 sheets per roll - 30 rolls per case

10 gal. Husky Gray

40 x 48 Clear

24 x 32 Extra Heavy White - 1000 per case
24 x 33 Clear .6mil. 15 gal. - 1000 per case
38 x 60 Black 1.4 mil. 60 gal. - 200 per case
38 x 58 Black 2 mil. 56 gal. - 100 per case
43 x 47 Black 2 mil. 56 gal. - 100 per case
Oreck CC - 8 bags per pkg.

Seal-It Floor Sealer - 4 gal. per case

VAl

Medical
$4.61
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

$17.33
$20.39

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
$41.46
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
$40.06
$25.73
$45.52
$38.26
$20.46
$21.50
$22.21
no bid
$32.45
no bid
$21.84
$26.91
$41.73
$42.24
no bid
no bid

2-5 Business Days
$0.00

Ennis Janitorial Supplies
$11.52

$0.58

$0.65

$12.31

$3.97

$4.89

$1.96

$6.14

$40.51 @ 1000 per case
$5.53 per box
$5.53 per box
$4.50 per can
$8.87

$10.89 @ 144 oz.
$22.05

$4.67

$9.10

$8.75

$3.85

$9.00

$11.70

$5.15 each
$5.15 each
$5.15 each
$13.89 per gallon
$5.82 per gallon
$1.58

$47.16

$68.40

$48.00

$4.65

$89.00

$35.64

$10.89

$113.80

$48.28

$11.75

$12.99

$3.63

$15.19

$10.89

$5.89

$51.40

25.92 - A-Jax
$5.70

$2.65

$49.20

$15.86

$33.00

$34.73

$46.75

) and $24.48 multi-fold bleached
$23.85

$22.85

$26.86

$19.50 (trash can) $17.26 @ 500 per case

$33.59

$23.88 @ 500 per case
$23.46

$31.39

$42.08

$31.95

$6.88

$13.89 per gallon

-5:00pm Monday through Friday
$0.00
Yes

$

R RV VR

All American

Poly
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid

31.98
47.44
54.36
41.02
20.87
19.14

B R IRV SRV SV Y RV IRV RV Y

Central Poly
Corporation

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid

56.66
27.90
61.70
17.90
17.91
17.92
27.91
14.20
18.10
19.80
13.20
18.90
26.00
23.40

10-21 Business Days

$0.00
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