Rem

Bleach-Liquid
Boitle

Bottle

Hroom

Broom landle
Brush

Disinfoctant
Disinfectant
Dispenser-Towel Combo
Dust Mop 'rame
Dus Mop landie
Dust Mop Head
Dust Pan

Duder

Duster

Floor Pad

Floor Pad

Floor Pad

Floor Stripper
Glass Cleaner
Gloves

lind Soap

Hand Soap

tand Seap

tnsect Repellant
Lice Spray
Multi-purposc {leaner
Mop

Mop-Bucket Combo
Mop-bucket Combo
Mop Handle

Mup tandlc

Muop Head

Pail

Pine-Sol Orange
Plunger

Powder Cleanser
Powder Cleanser
Rags-T Shin

Scrub Brush
Stainless Steel Cleaner
Super Gloss Floor Finish
Toilet Tissue

Toilet Tissue

Toilet lissue

Towel

Towel

Towel

Towel

Irash Can Liner
Irash Can Liner
Trash Can Liner
Trash Can Liner
Teaxh Can Liner
frash Can Liaer
Vacuum Bag

Wax Scaler

Description

1 gal. - 6 per case

Plastic 320z

Trigger Speayer - Rod White

24" Black Prolenc

Metal Tip 1 18"

Counter - Gray Flagged

Toilet Bowl

197 Plastic Dk - Cream

160z. - 500 pez case

Heavy Duty - Wit - 100 picces - 10 per case
Hieavy Duty - White - 100 picces - 10 per case
“Tine Retease - Fresh Linen - 7 oz

Pinc Terminator - 1 gal.

Pinc-Sol - Orange - | gal

Multi-Fold Plastic

5°x24"

ClipOn

5724 Blue

127 Plastic

Swiffer Refill 10 per box

Swifler with handle

20" Black Strip - § per case

20" Red Spray Bufl

20" White - § fxT casc

Ultra Stnp Floot Stnpper - 4 gal. per case
Sparkie Ready 1o Use - 1802

Poly Food Service Giliwes - Large - 100 per box
Aantibacterial Out of Sight - %60 m). - 12 bostes per case
Magic - 3.55). - 4 percase

Dial - 4 gal. per case.

Spray - 20 oz,

1602 - 12 per casc:

Mainwain Newtra) Cleancr - 4 gal. per case
3202 - Deck Cotton

‘With Funnc! Wringer - 35 qt.

3s5qt

Clamp On Plastic Head

Clamp On Fiterglass Sidelock

244 Clamp On Colton - White

14 gt. Gray Rim

1440z

Toilaflex

Comet Cleancr with Bleach - 32 02. - 8 per case
With Bleach 2loz - 24 cans pex case
Colored Mix 107

kon Handle

Water Base - 20 02,

1gal

500 Count - 96 rolls per case

2-Piy - White - 12 rolls per case.

1-ply - White - 0 sheets - 96 rolls per case
Single Fold Bleachad - 4XW per case

2" Natral towels 350" - 12 rolls pes case
Multi Fold-Natural 250 Count - $000 towels per case
%) Sheuts per roll - 30 rotls por case

10 gal. - Flusky gray

0548 Clear 16mil, 45 gal. - 25¢ per case
24x33 Clear Gamil. 15 gal. - 1000 per case
38x60 Clear 14nul. 60 ga). - 200 per case
3%x58 Black 2mil. 60 gal. - 100 7 case
43547 Black 2aul. 36 gal - 100 per case
Oreck CC - 8 hags per phg.

Seal- Floor Sealer - 4 gal. per case

Percentage (%) discount will be given on any ltem not listed oa this bld

Delivery Time:

Delivery Fee (if any):

Same Day Dellvery: yesorno

Awarded Primary

'3S-EJS, Inc-Enals Jsaltorial

Awanded Sccondary

Desoto Janitorial Supply
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Janitorial Supplies

US-EJS, Ine-EnsisJasitorial’. Interboro Packaging Corp  All Americsa Poly
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Janpak Desote JanMorial Supply
Price Priget.

9.55
046
0.57
19.00
2355
495
245
6.70
41.00
27.00
27,00
3600
2800
2800
29.00
315
92
1396
193
2%
9.22
1441
1441
1341
3200
2762
273
2300
no bid
50.00
5100
6.0
26.70
14.00
87.00
67.00
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Share Corp. UniPak Corp Pyramid School

Price Price Price
oo bid no bid oo bid
s 1.00 robid S 0.3
nobid § 037
nobid § 3.9
mobid § 298
nobid § 19
nobid S 1.06
sobid S 319
oo bid no bid
oo bid no bid
o bid no bid
nobid S 269
0o bid no bid
10 bid no bid
nobid S 2w
nobid $ R
nobid S 498
sobid $ 3
nobid § 198
nobid $ 129
nobid S 39
nobid § 1169
nobid § 11.69
nobid S 11.69
0o bid oo bid
vobid $ %
sobid S 058
nobid S 39.9%
Bo bl o0 bid
nobid § 59.92
robid § 4790
nobid  § 38.95
no bid no hid
no bid no hid
oo bid B0 bid
no bid o bid
oohid $ 599
nabid S 798
nobid $ 2P
nobid § 519
no bid oo bid
nobid S 439
oobid S 09y
nobid § 2795
oo bid 2o bid
nobid § L9
nobid § 978
no bid no bid
no bid o bid
no bid oo bid
no tid no bid
Do bid no bid
oo brd no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no hid
no bid no bid no bid
no bid no bid no bid
nohid § 1650 no bid
nobid §  29% no bid
aobid S 3650 no bid
sobd § 2650 oo bid
oo bid no bid no bid
45.00 o0 bid oo bid
15% 0% 0%
4-days 1-7 davwARO 10-14 days'ARO
none nong min. orderfull cases only
Bo oo LU

Calico Industries  Roas Medical  Central Poly
Price Price Price
no bid oo bid no bid
s 099 00 bid oo bid
s 054 00 bid no bid
s 85.94 no bid no bid
s 49.34 oo bid oo bid
s 294 no bid no bid
H 1.54 no bid no bid
no bid nobid no bid
no bid oo bid ro bid
s 19.94 no hd 00 hid
s 19.94 no bid 0o bid
0o bid oo bid 0o bid
no bid 00 bid no bhid
oo bid no bid no bid
no bid 0o bid no bid
s 254 oo bid 1o bid
s 6.24 0o bid no bid
s 92.54 no bid no bid
s 274 no bid no bl
nobid no bid 0o bid
no bid no bid no bid
s 1818 ne bid 0o bid
s 1818 no bid o bid
H 1318 no bid 2o bid
oo bid no bid no bid
no bid no bid no bid
oo bid nobid $ 063
oo bid o bid no bid
no bid 0o bid no bid
nobid $ 5540 oo bid
no bid no bid no bid
no bid no bid 0o bid
no hid 20 bid no bid
S 554 aohid 8o bid
s 6578 S H00 no bid
s 5543 S o oo bid
s 534 nobwd 0o bid
S 794 no bid nobid
N 3418 no bid 1o bid
H 794 no bid no bid
nohid no bid no bid
no bid Bo bid a0 bid
no bid a0 bid 0o bid
oo bid nobid oo bid
s 15.54 ne bid no bid
s 123 no bid oo bid
no bid a0 bid no bid
no bid 1o bid
no bid nobid $ 41.60
no bid no bid o bid
oo bid nobid S 460
oo bid nokd S 1899
oo bid obd $ 19.30
S 4.9 mobid S 199
no bid nobid $  28.60
s 17.69 nobid $ 19.60
s 33.20 nohid § 39.10
H 2340 nobid S 249
s 2940 nobid $ 3740
s 36.36 nohid S 410
s 384 oobid § 3o
no bid oo bid Bo bid
no bid oo bid oo bid
20% NA 0%
30 days ARO 2 daywARO 0-14 bus davs.
Booc NA none
fricght charge S350
no no [

Office Depot
Price

oo bid

oo bid

s 049
s 1909
1o bid
a0 bid
00 bid
0o bid
Do bid
oo bid
oo bid
oo bid
9279
1299
no bid
S 239

“un

o0 bid
149
9.99

17.99
no bid
no bid

oo hid

wow

s 249
o bad
no bid
o bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
5399
1289
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ftem Description

Bleach Liguid 1 gal. - 6 per case

Bowde Plastxc 20z

DBottle Ingger Sprayer - Red White

Bawa 24° Blach Protene

Baom Handle Ml lip 1 1 3°

Brush Counter - Gray Flagged

Brush Toik Bowl

Brush 10" Plastic Deck - Crcam

Sthyrefam Cup 160z - 500 per casc

Cutlary-Fold Heany Duty - White - 100 paoxes - 10 per case
Cutlery Spon Hheavy Duty « White - 300 peoces - 10 pey case
Dendosiay Time Releasc - Fresh Linen - 7 0z
Insintectant Pine 1crminator - | gal

Insinfoctant PincSel  Orange | gal.

Digpenser- dowed Combo Multi-Fold Plastxe

BDust Mop Frame S

Dust Mop Handlc Clipln

Duxt Map bead 5024 Blue

Dust Pan 127 Plastic

Duster Suatfer Refill 10 pes bov

Duser Swilker with handk:

Fhoow Pad 20° Black Stip - § e case

Flar Pad 2u” Rad Speay Bl

Fhouw Pad 207 Whae - 5 pey caw

Flowr Stnppr Ul Stsip Flowr Stipper - 4 gal. por case
Gilass Cleancy Sparkle Ready Lot - 190z,

Gloves Poly Foud Senace Glknes - Large - 100 per bux
and Seap Antrhactorial Out of Sight - KO @l + 12 bties per case
Tand Soap Magic - 3551, - 4 per case

Hand Soap aal - 4 gal. per cane

st Repeilant Spray - 2 oz,

Lace Spray 160z, - 12 pez came

Mult-purpeme Cleaner Mainwin Neutral Cleaner - 4 gal. per case
Mop 320z - Dok Cotton

Mop-Hockat Combe With Funnel Wanger - 35 gt

Mop-huchat Cumbe L 2]

Mop landie Clamp On Plastic ticad

Mop llandic Clamp Oa Fiborglass Sidekoch

Mop Head 247 Clanp On Cotton - White

Pail 1491 Gray Rim

PucoSol < range 14407

Planp urlatien

Powder Claanar Conct Cleaner with Bleach - 32 oz - 8 por case
Powder Cleansr With Bleach 210z « 24 cans pey cae

Rags-1 Stun “olonad Mia [0s

Scrub Brush T Handle

Sumleo Stoel Cleaner Watar Hase - 200z

Super Gikoes bt Frand Lt

Tkt lisaue 300 Count - 96 rolls gy case

[ FERY 2.Ply - White - 12 nulls pur caxe

Foika liasue 1-ply - White - 1000 sheets - 96 rolls per case
Towel Single Fold Bleached - 4000 per cae

towel R™Natural toacls T80« 12 rolls per case:
Toue! Mutt Fold-Natural 250 Count - 4000 tw cle por case
lowel X0 Shouts per noll - 30 rulls per case

Trash Can bmer 10 gal. - Uusky pray

Irash Can daner 0248 Clear 1602l 45 gal. - 250 per casc
Trash Can $aner 24233 Clear Ganil 15 gal - 1000 per cane
ra<h Can $aner WAttt Clear 1ol 60 gal - 2K per e
Braoh Can Liner 38058 Black 2nul 60 gal - 100 per case
Trash Can Janer 4307 Black 2mit 56 gal - 100 per caxe
Vacuum Hag Orh OC - X Bags et phy

Wan Scaler Scal-h Fhur Scaler - 4 gal pur case

Perecntage (%) dlscount will be given on sny ltem ot tsted sa this bid
Delivery Time:
Detivery Fee (if sny):
Same Day Delivery: yevor no
Awatdald Primury
IS-ESS. boc-Ensts Jasiteria)

Awarded Socondan
Desoto Janiterial Supply
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1740
2100
1800
3000
17.50
LR
36.25
3300
oo bad
7168
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Share Corp, UniPask Carp  Pyramid Scheel

Calice lndmtries  Ress Medica! Central Pely Office Depot

Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

oo bid oo bid oo bid oo bid oo bd no bid ou bid

b LLUH oobid S (151 20 1 0.y no bd ou tad oo nd

s 1.2 oobd S @37 s 054 no bad nobd $ 04y

o bid oobd S s 3594 oo bad nubed $ woy

0o hid sobd S 29 s 4934 o did no bed 0o ba

no bid nmbd S L9y $ 294 no bid o0 bid 00 b

no bid wbid S 1456 S 1.54 oo bid o bid o0 bid

oo bid pobid § 3 Do bad a0 bl oo b o0 bul

00 bid o0 bid o0 bwd oo bud oo bid 00 bl o0 bl

no bed oo bed nobid $ 1994 o0 bad ov bul o0 bud

o0 bad oo bed oobid $ 199 oo bed o6 bl o bad

$ 600 nobd $ 269 o0 bid o bid o bid o bid

s 12w no bid oo bid oo bid oo tnd whd $ 979

s 12w 1o bed o0 bid 0o bad o bid oobd S 129

00 bid cobid $ pR oo bad 0o bed o bed o0 bud

00 b nobd $ 2 s 254 oo bad oo S 2.3y

00 bid nobed S 493§ oo b b $ kR

o bid nobd § 39 s no bid oo bd oo bed

oo bid nobid § 18§ no bd mehd S L4y

no bid nobd S 129 oo kg oohid $ 9w

na bid oobd $ 498 oo bid robd 3 179w

s I oobd S e s o0 bid o0 but oo bed

s I pobid § ey s o0 bt o0 bid oo bed

s I oobd $ ney s o bad o0 hed a0 bl

s Wy oo bud ou bad oo id a0 b oo bl

$ .00 oobid $ 2798 nobnd b § 249

oo bid oobd S (53] nobd § w6l o bid

oobd S 3998 a0 bid a0 bid 00 bed

00 b ou bid a0 hd o hed o bed

oobd S 5992 s 50 oo bad o bd

oobd S 4798 oo bed 0o hed pobud

oohd S 3893 o0 bad e bidd o0 hid

s hid no bid o bid no hid no bid

o bad nobid § o0 bed o0 bed oo bid

oo bud oobd $ Hoo oo bed o0 tad

oo bad nobd $ s Hw b § s3Iy

oobd S 398 Do b tobd § 1289

aobid S 198 S oo bid nokd S 6.5%

oobid § 2y s 0o wohd $ 49y

oobw S 51 s i bad o bad oo bid

o bad 0o bid oo bad o hed oo bid

cobd S 439 00 bud oo bl o bad

sobid $ 2.9 oo bd 0o bid o bed

nobd S .95 oo by no bnd 1o bl

a0 bid oubd $ nobid oo bed 0o bt

oobid § 19 3 oo bid 0o bad 00 bid

oobd S W75 0 bud nobid S 2ay

00 bed oo tad a0 bed o0 bl

oo bud oo bid nobd e s 999

o0 bl o bid 0o bad subd § 2693

oo bid oo bid oobid $ Hw oo b

oo hid no bid oobid $ 899§ (LR

o bud oo bid nobd $ 1930 s (LR

oo tid nobid $ nobd S 199 s 1669

o bl no ted oobsd 3 M S 27

0o b nobud $ oobul S 9 3 .59

oo d nobd S mbd S wio s 282

16.50 nobid S bl 3 RL Y 25.61

29 3% robd $ onhid § 3Ta o0 bl

16.50 pobid nobud S 4150 oo b

26.50 bt $ oobwd S 3o 00 hal

B bid o bad o0 ba o bad o bad

$ 500 oo bad a0 bed oo bul o bad o bad
15% 1% 2% pH2Y N'A 0%
4days 1-7 favw ARO 10-14 dayw AR 30days ARO 2dayx ARO G-14 bus davs
oooe oooe min. vedarful] cases oaly oooe NA none

Frieght charge $330
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