
Vulcan Materials - AWARDED

Grade 3

PCT. #1 PCT. #2 PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4

PALMER ENNIS ITALY MAYPEARL MIDLOTHIAN

PICKED UP 19.00$  19.00$ 19.00$ 19.00$       19.00$           

DELIVERED TO PCT YARD 36.61$  36.88$ 37.05$ 33.87$       32.45$           

PER MILE 0.177$  0.177$ 0.177$ 0.177$       0.177$           

MILES TO PCT YARD 99 101 102 84 76

Grade 4

PCT. #1 PCT. #2 PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4

PALMER ENNIS ITALY MAYPEARL MIDLOTHIAN

PICKED UP 19.00$  19.00$ 19.00$ 19.00$       19.00$           

DELIVERED TO PCT YARD 36.61$  36.88$ 37.05$ 33.87$       32.45$           

PER MILE 0.177$  0.177$ 0.177$ 0.177$       0.177$           

MILES TO PCT YARD 99 101 102 84 76

Grade 5

PCT. #1 PCT. #2 PCT. #3 PCT. #3 PCT. #4

PALMER ENNIS ITALY MAYPEARL MIDLOTHIAN

PICKED UP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DELIVERED TO PCT YARD

PER MILE

MILES TO PCT YARD

CRUSHED LIMESTONE CHIP SEAL TYPE D, GRADE 3, 5/8" ROCK

CRUSHED LIMESTONE CHIP SEAL TYPE D, GRADE 4, 1/2" ROCK

CRUSHED LIMESTONE CHIP SEAL TYPE D, GRADE 5, 3/8" ROCK

EXPIRES 4/6/2016
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